stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com

From: stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com
Subject: Quote for further guttering works at Cemetery

From: L M Building & Maintenance <Immaintenance@mail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 20, 2024 12:54 PM

To: Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com>

Subject: Re: RE: Re: RE: Re: Quote for clearing gutters at Cemetery Lodge in Stretton

Hi kath the quote to remove lvy, do the bracket and replace section at frount is £319
Did you receive the invoce.
Thanks Lawrence

Sent from my Android phone with mail.com Mail. Please excuse my brevity.
On 20/02/2024, 11:07 Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com> wrote:

Sorry for the delay Lawrence, can you give me a quote for this work?

Kind Regards

Kath

Kath Gruber

Stretton Parish Council
Clerk/RFO
07595515154

From: L M Building & Maintenance <Immaintenance@mail.com>

Sent: Friday, February 16, 2024 1:03 PM

To: Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com>

Subject: Re: RE: Re: Quote for clearing gutters at Cemetery Lodge in Stretton

The frount gutter wants totally replacing as it dosnt clip together properly. There is a bracket needs going on round
the back and all the ivy needs removing off the stone work and roof as it's started moving under the roof slates into

the roof and as it grows will cause all sorts of problems thanks Lawrence

Sent from my Android phone with mail.com Mail. Please excuse my brevity.
On 11/01/2024, 14:01 Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com> wrote:

Yes there are and I’'m advised they need clearing too Lawrence. What would you charge?

Kind Regards

Kath
Kath Gruber
Stretton Parish Council



Clerk/RFO
07595515154

From: L M Building & Maintenance <Immaintenance@mail.com>
Sent: Monday, January 8, 2024 10:13 AM

To: Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com>

Subject: Re: Quote for clearing gutters at Cemetery Lodge in Stretton

Hiis it just them 2 sets or I'd there some more on the back thanks Lawrence

Sent from my Android phone with mail.com Mail. Please excuse my brevity.
On 08/01/2024, 10:10 Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com> wrote:

Hi Lawrence here are some pictures of gutters that need clearing at our cemetery lodge house in Stretton, can
you tell me what it would cost to do this job please?

Kind Regards

Kath

Kath Gruber

Stretton Parish Council
Clerk/RFO
07595515154

From: joseph bojtor <joebojtor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, January 7, 2024 1:55 PM

To: Kath Gruber <stretton-parishcouncil@outlook.com>
Subject: Gutter pics,

Hi Kath,

Sorry about the title.
Also sorry for the delay

Take care
Joe

Sent from Qutlook for Android




